

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 12, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Landscaping Equipment				LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	Alternate #1 LOCAL	Alternate #2 LOCAL	Alternate #3 LOCAL
6100014084		GDL		DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 684-5296	Watts Equipment, Inc. dba Mustang Equipment 16331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX 78233 (512) 535-8955	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 3030 N. Austin St. Seguin TX 78155 (830) 243-8855	Certified Small Engine Repair 7510 Tezel Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 523-1138	Vermeer Texas 16593 IH 35 North Selma TX 78154 (210) 337-7700	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78251	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78252	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78253
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity									
1	60 Inch Zero Turn Gas Mower - Side Discharge Price Each:	19	\$8,559.00	\$10,300 + Extra Set of Blades	FY21 \$9,397.83 x 3 FY22 \$8,990.79 x 16	\$10,250.00			\$9,069.06	\$9,199.00	\$9,955.92
	Total:		\$162,621.00	\$195,700 19 Sets of Blades N/C	\$172,046.13	\$194,750.00	No Bid		\$172,312.14	\$174,781.00	\$189,162.48
	Make & Model of Mower Offered:		Cub Pro Z 560L	SCAG SCZII-61V-EFI	John Deere Z950M	Scag Cheetah II 61"			Gravely 992269 Pro-Turn	Cub Pro Z 760L	Gravely 992297 Mach One
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include SAE Net HP):		Kawasaki FX850V 27HP	37 HP Briggs Vanguard Fuel Injected	FX850V Kawasaki 27HP	Briggs & Stratton EFI 37 HP			Kawasaki FX850V, 27 HP	Kawasaki FX921V, 31 HP	Kawasaki FX921V, 31 HP
	Transmission Offered:		Parker HTJ Series 12cc pump/260cc wheel motor		Belt Driven Hydrostatic Tuff Torq Heavy Duty Wheel Motors	2 Spd 2T-5400 Hydrogen 16 MPH Forward 8 MPH Reverse			Hydro-Gear ZT-5400	14cc Parker HTG pump with hydro release lever	Hydro-Gear ZT-5400
	Mower Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements stated herein):		3 Year / no hour limit commercial warranty and 5 year / 1,750 hour limited deck construction warranty	2 Years	36 Months or 1,200 hours 1st 24 months No hour Limitations	2 Year Warranty Mower 3 Year Deck			5 Year/1,250 Hour Commercial/No Hour Limit First 2 Years	3 Year / no hour limit commercial warranty and 5 year / 1,750 hour limited deck construction warranty	5 Year / 1,250 Hour Limited / No Hour Limit First Two Years
	Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		DeWinne Equipment Company	Mustang Equipment	Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC 21 Locations	Certified Small Engine Repair			DeWinne Equipment Company	DeWinne Equipment Company	DeWinne Equipment Company
	Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250	16331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX	8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio 133 CR 4718 Castroville, TX or 3030 N Austin St. Seguin, TX	7510 Tezel Road San Antonio, TX 78250			11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250	11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250	11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250
	Delivery:		45 Calendar Days	7 Calendar Days	90 Calendar Days	7 Calendar Days			45 Calendar Days	45 Calendar Days	45 Calendar Days
	Production Cut-off Date:		9/30/2021	See Attached Addendum	Nov 1, 2021	2020			9/30/2021	9/30/2021	9/30/2021
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:		9/30/2021		10/25/21	Dec '21			9/30/2021	9/30/2021	9/30/2021
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		Yes, until 12-31-21	Yes	No, we will try	Yes			Yes, until 12-31-21	Yes, until 12-31-23	Yes, until 12-31-24

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 12, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Landscaping Equipment				LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	Alternate #1 LOCAL	Alternate #2 LOCAL	Alternate #3 LOCAL
6100014084		GDL		DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 684-5296	Watts Equipment, Inc. dba Mustang Equipment 16331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX 78233 (512) 535-8955	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 3030 N. Austin St. Seguin TX 78155 (830) 243-8855	Certified Small Engine Repair 7510 Tezel Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 523-1138	Vermeer Texas 16593 IH 35 North Selma TX 78154 (210) 337-7700	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78251	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78252	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78253
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity									
2	60 Inch Zero Turn Gas Mower - Rear Discharge Price Each: Total: Make & Model of Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Mower Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements stated herein): Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	3	No Bid	\$10,300.00 +Extra Set of Blades \$30,900.00 +3 Sets of Blades	FY21 \$11,328 x 2 FY22 \$10,832.79 x 1 \$33,488.79		\$10,350.00 \$31,050.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
				SCAG SCZII-61RD-31FX 31 HP Kawasaki	John Deere Z950R FX850V Kawasaki 27 HP		Scag Cheetah II RD 61" Kawasaki 31 HP FX Engine				
				2 Years	36 Months or 1,500 Hours / 1st 24 Months Unlimited Hrs		2 Spd 2T-5400 Hydrogen 16 MPH Forward 8 MPH Reverse 2 Year Warranty Mower 3 Year Deck				
				Mustang Equipment	Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC		Certified Small Engine Repair				
				165331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX	8787 Bandera Rd San Antonio / 133 CR 4713 Castroville TX or 3030 N Austin St. Seguin TX		7510 Tezel Road San Antonio TX 78250				
				7 Calendar Days	90 Calendar Days		7 Calendar Days				
				See Attached Addendum	Nov 1		2020				
					10/25/21		Dec '21				
				Yes	No, we will try		Yes				

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 12, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Landscaping Equipment 6100014084		GDL		LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	Alternate #1 LOCAL	Alternate #2 LOCAL	Alternate #3 LOCAL
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 684-5296	Watts Equipment, Inc. dba Mustang Equipment 16331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX 78233 (512) 535-8955	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 3030 N. Austin St. Seguin TX 78155 (830) 243-8855	Certified Small Engine Repair 7510 Tezel Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 523-1138	Vermeer Texas 16593 IH 35 North Selma TX 78154 (210) 337-7700	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78251	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78252	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78253	
3	4x4 Utility Tractor w/Enclosed Cab Price Each: Total: Make & Model of Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements stated herein): Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$60,401.09 \$60,401.09 John Deere 5075M 3 Cylinder 2.9L John Deere Power Tech 3029 73.8 EHP 57.7 PTO HI 16 Forward 16 Reverse 5,685 lbs 3 pt 24 Months or 2,000 Hrs Tellus Equip 21 Locations Tellus S.A. 8587 Bandera Rd, S.A. Tellus Castroville 133 CR 4718, Castroville Tellus Seguin 3030 N Austin St Seguin 180 Calendar Days Nov 1 2021 10/25/21 No, will try though	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 12, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Landscaping Equipment 6100014084		GDL		LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	Alternate #1 LOCAL	Alternate #2 LOCAL	Alternate #3 LOCAL
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 684-5296	Watts Equipment, Inc. dba Mustang Equipment 16331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX 78233 (512) 535-8955	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 3030 N. Austin St. Seguin TX 78155 (830) 243-8855	Certified Small Engine Repair 7510 Tezel Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 523-1138	Vermeer Texas 16593 IH 35 North Selma TX 78154 (210) 337-7700	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78251	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78252	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78253	
4	15 Feet Flex Wing Rotary Cutter Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price differential Make & Model of Cutter Offered: Specific Make & Model of PTO Offered (include SAE Net HP): Gear Box Offered: Cutter Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements stated herein): Cutter Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cutter Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	26	No Bid	\$19,600.00 \$509,600.00 6.01% \$28,901.34 John Deere R15 Flex Wing Rotary Cutter 55 HP 1 Year Full 5 Year Gear Box Mustang Equipment Same as above 90 Calendar Days 19 October 2021 August 31 Yes	\$18,488.41 \$480,698.66 JD John Deere R15 CUASAE Cut 6 Main/ ASAE Cut 5 Connecting 540 PTO RPM 250 Continuous Peak 300 HP 1 Yr Comprehensive 5 Yrs Gearbox Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio / 133 CR 4718 Castroville / or 3030 N Austin St, Seguin TX 180 Calendar Days Nov 1, 2021 10/25/21 No, we will try	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 12, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Landscaping Equipment										Alternate #1		Alternate #2		Alternate #3		
6100014084		GDL		LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	LOCAL	LOCAL	LOCAL	LOCAL	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 684-5296	Watts Equipment, Inc. dba Mustang Equipment 16331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX 78233 (512) 535-8955	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 3030 N. Austin St. Seguin TX 78155 (830) 243-8855	Certified Small Engine Repair 7510 Tezel Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 523-1138	Vermeer Texas 16593 IH 35 North Selma TX 78154 (210) 337-7700	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78251	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78252	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78253						
5	Deleted															
6	Stand on Blower Price Each: Total: Make & Model of Blower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Blower Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements stated herein): Blower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Blower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	3	\$9,728.00 \$29,184.00 Billy Goat Z3000 Vanguard V-Twin 993cc 35hp Twin HYDRO-GEAR 3100 IZTs 2 Years DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Calendar Days 9/30/2021 9/30/2021 No	\$9,300.00 \$27,900.00 SCAG WS23-38BV -EFI 38HP Briggs Vanguard Fuel Injected 2 Years Mustang Equipment 165331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX 78233 7 Calendar Days See Attached Addendum Yes	No Bid	\$8,879.00 \$26,637.00 Scag Windstorm WS23-37 BU-EFI Briggs & Stratton Vanguard 37 HP EFI 12cc Hydrogen Pumps 14ci Parker Wheel Motors 2 Year Machine 3 Year Engine Certified Small Engine Repair 7510 Tezel Road San Antonio, TX 78250 7 Calendar Days 2020 Dec '21 Yes	No Bid	\$9,728.00 \$29,184.00 Billy Goat Z3000 Vanguard V-Twin 993cc 35hp Twin HYDRO-GEAR 3100 IZTs 2 Years DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Calendar Days 9/30/2021 9/30/2021 No	\$9,728.00 \$29,184.00 Billy Goat Z3000 Vanguard V-Twin 993cc 35hp Twin HYDRO-GEAR 3100 IZTs 2 Years DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Calendar Days 9/30/2021 9/30/2021 No	\$9,728.00 \$29,184.00 Billy Goat Z3000 Vanguard V-Twin 993cc 35hp Twin HYDRO-GEAR 3100 IZTs 2 Years DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Calendar Days 9/30/2021 9/30/2021 No						

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 12, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Landscaping Equipment				LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	Alternate #1 LOCAL	Alternate #2 LOCAL	Alternate #3 LOCAL
6100014084		GDL		DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 684-5296	Watts Equipment, Inc. dba Mustang Equipment 16331 Pleasantville Road San Antonio TX 78233 (512) 535-8955	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 3030 N. Austin St. Seguin TX 78155 (830) 243-8855	Certified Small Engine Repair 7510 Tezel Road San Antonio TX 78250 (210) 523-1138	Vermeer Texas 16593 IH 35 North Selma TX 78154 (210) 337-7700	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78251	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78252	DeWinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Road San Antonio TX 78253
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity									
7	Wood Chipper Price Each: Total: Make & Model of Chipper Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (include SAE Net HP): Drum Speed Offered: Chipper Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements stated herein): Chipper Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Chipper Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Payment Terms Estimated Annual Total Estimated Annual Award	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$47,150.00 \$47,150.00 Vermeer BC1000xL Devtz TD2.9L Tier 4 Final 2,050 RPM 1 Year / 1,000 Hour (whichever comes first) Vermeer Texas 16593 IH35N Selma TX 78154 120 Calendar Days N/A 12/31/2021 Yes Net 30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
			\$191,805.00	\$764,100.00	\$746,634.67	\$252,437.00	\$47,150.00	\$201,496.14	\$203,965.00	\$218,346.48	
			\$162,621.00	\$30,900.00	\$541,099.75	\$26,637.00	\$47,150.00				

Deleted: Item 5 will be re-bid at a later date